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Marketing LLC

ULSD Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 1 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.0224 $0.0250 $0.0231 No Bid $0.0315

ULSD Truck Transport AUTOMATIC Zone 1 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.0240 $0.0250 $0.0241 No Bid $0.0318

Winter Blend ULSD Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 1 - Net Price Differential per 

Gallon
$0.0313 $0.0375 $0.0300 No Bid $0.0318

Winter Blend ULSD Truck Transport AUTOMATIC Zone 1 - Net Price Differential per 

Gallon
$0.0424 $0.0375 $0.0311 No Bid $0.0318

ULSD Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 2 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.0651 $0.2500 $0.0695 No Bid $0.0655

ULSD Truck Transport AUTOMATIC Zone 2 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.0649 $0.1800 $0.0711 No Bid $0.0655

Winter Blend ULSD Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 2 - Net Price Differential per 

Gallon
$0.0800 $0.2800 $0.0951 No Bid $0.0930

Winter Blend ULSD Truck Transport AUTOMATIC Zone 2 - Net Price Differential per 

Gallon
$0.0975 $0.2100 $0.1117 No Bid $0.0980

ULSD Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 3 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.0343 $0.0325 $0.0370 $0.0744 $0.0534

ULSD Truck Transport AUTOMATIC Zone 3 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.0349 $0.0325 $0.0385 No Bid $0.0534

Winter Blend ULSD Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 3 - Net Price Differential per 

Gallon
$0.0659 $0.0385 $0.0395 $0.0894 $0.0534

Winter Blend ULSD Truck Transport AUTOMATIC Zone 3 - Net Price Differential per 

Gallon
$0.0659 $0.0385 $0.0395 No Bid $0.0534

PART ONE: DIESEL - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 2 - MONTGOMERY COUNTY, MARYLAND

PART ONE: DIESEL - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 3 - PRINCE GEORGE'S COUNTY, MARYLAND

Metropolitan Council of Governments (COG) IFB#22-004

Online Bidding for Cooperative Purchase of Ultra-low Sulfur Diesel (Reverse Auction)

Final Net Price Differentials ‐ April 8, 2022

PART ONE: DIESEL - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 1 METROPOLITAN VIRGINIA
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ULSD Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 4 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.0362 $0.0350 $0.0365 No Bid $0.0599

ULSD Truck Transport AUTOMATIC Zone 4 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.0380 $0.0370 $0.0384 No Bid $0.0600

Winter Blend ULSD Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 4 - Net Price Differential per 

Gallon
$0.0610 $0.0350 $0.0370 No Bid $0.0600

Winter Blend ULSD Truck Transport AUTOMATIC Zone 4 - Net Price Differential per 

Gallon
$0.0610 $0.0350 $0.0389 No Bid $0.0600

ULSD Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 5 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.0298 $0.0250 $0.0418 $0.0374 $0.0426

ULSD Truck Transport AUTOMATIC Zone 5 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.0298 $0.0250 $0.0450 No Bid $0.0426

Winter Blend ULSD Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 5 - Net Price Differential per 

Gallon
$0.0298 $0.0250 $0.0418 $0.0395 $0.0426

Winter Blend ULSD Truck Transport AUTOMATIC Zone 5 - Net Price Differential per 

Gallon
$0.0298 $0.0250 $0.0451 No Bid $0.0426

ULSD Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 6 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.0546 $0.0450 $0.0746 $0.0882 $0.0726

ULSD Truck Transport AUTOMATIC Zone 6 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.0597 $0.0550 $0.0792 No Bid $0.0726

Winter Blend ULSD Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 6 - Net Price Differential per 

Gallon
$0.0599 $0.0550 $0.0771 $0.0902 $0.0726

Winter Blend ULSD Truck Transport AUTOMATIC Zone 6 - Net Price Differential per 

Gallon
$0.0599 $0.0450 $0.0792 No Bid $0.0776

PART ONE: DIESEL - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 4 - WASHINGTON, DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

PART ONE: DIESEL - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 5 - ANNE ARUNDEL COUNTY, MARYLAND

PART ONE: DIESEL - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 6 - CARROLL COUNTY, MARYLAND
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ULSD Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 7 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.0630 $0.0625 $0.0662 $0.0987 $0.0914

ULSD Truck Transport AUTOMATIC Zone 7 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.0647 $0.0625 $0.0782 No Bid $0.0914

Winter Blend ULSD Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 7 - Net Price Differential per 

Gallon
$0.0624 $0.0620 $0.0662 $0.1137 $0.0914

Winter Blend ULSD Truck Transport AUTOMATIC Zone 7 - Net Price Differential per 

Gallon
$0.0649 $0.0650 $0.0782 No Bid $0.0914

ULSD Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 1 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4089 $0.2200 $0.2214 No Bid $0.4164

ULSD Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC Zone 1 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4100 $0.2200 $0.2214 No Bid $0.4164

Winter Blend ULSD Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 1 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4100 $0.2200 $0.2239 No Bid $0.4164

Winter Blend ULSD Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC Zone 1 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4100 $0.2200 $0.2254 No Bid $0.4164

ULSD Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 2 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4200 $0.5500 $0.4442 No Bid $0.4164

ULSD Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC Zone 2 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4200 $0.5000 $0.4576 No Bid $0.4164

Winter Blend ULSD Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 2 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4200 $0.5800 $0.4622 No Bid $0.4164

Winter Blend ULSD Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC Zone 2 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4200 $0.5300 $0.4776 No Bid $0.4164

PART TWO: DIESEL - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 1 - METROPOLITAN VIRGINIA

PART TWO: DIESEL - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 2 - MONTGOMERY COUNTY, MARYLAND

PART ONE: DIESEL - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 7 - CHARLES COUNTY, MARYLAND
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ULSD Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 3 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4189 $0.2650 $0.2695 No Bid No Bid

ULSD Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC Zone 3 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4189 $0.2700 $0.2920 No Bid No Bid

Winter Blend ULSD Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 3 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4189 $0.2650 $0.2698 No Bid No Bid

Winter Blend ULSD Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC Zone 3 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4189 $0.2700 $0.2920 No Bid No Bid

ULSD Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 4 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4198 $0.4000 $1.7000 No Bid No Bid

ULSD Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC Zone 4 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4198 $0.4100 $1.7000 No Bid No Bid

Winter Blend ULSD Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 4 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4198 $0.4100 $1.7000 No Bid No Bid

Winter Blend ULSD Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC Zone 4 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4198 $0.4100 $1.7000 No Bid No Bid

ULSD Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 5 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4198 $0.4000 $1.7000 No Bid No Bid

ULSD Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC Zone 5 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4198 $0.4100 $1.7000 No Bid No Bid

Winter Blend ULSD Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 5 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4198 $0.4100 $1.7000 No Bid No Bid

Winter Blend ULSD Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC Zone 5 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4198 $0.4100 $1.7000 No Bid No Bid

PART TWO: DIESEL - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 4 - WASHINGTON, DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

PART TWO: DIESEL - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 5 - ANNE ARUNDEL COUNTY, MARYLAND

PART TWO: DIESEL - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 3 - PRINCE GEORGE'S COUNTY, MARYLAND
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ULSD Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 6 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4198 $0.4000 $1.7000 No Bid No Bid

ULSD Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC Zone 6 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4198 $0.4000 $1.7000 No Bid No Bid

Winter Blend ULSD Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 6 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4198 $0.4000 $1.7000 No Bid No Bid

Winter Blend ULSD Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC Zone 6 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4198 $0.4000 $1.7000 No Bid No Bid

ULSD Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 7 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4689 $0.0450 $0.5236 No Bid No Bid

ULSD Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC Zone 7 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4689 $0.0450 $1.3036 No Bid No Bid

Winter Blend ULSD Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 7 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4689 $0.4500 $0.5236 No Bid No Bid

Winter Blend ULSD Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC Zone 7 - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.4689 $0.4500 $1.3036 No Bid No Bid

ULSD BALTIMORE - Net Price Differential Per Gallon ($-0.0025) $0.0025 $0.0044 No Bid No Bid

ULSD FAIRFAX - Net Price Differential per Gallon ($-0.0029) $0.0005 $0.0020 No Bid No Bid

Winter Blend ULSD BALTIMORE - Net Price Differential per Gallon ($-0.0025) $0.0005 $0.0044 No Bid No Bid

Winter Blend ULSD FAIRFAX - Net Price Differential per Gallon $0.0501 $0.0005 $0.0020 No Bid No Bid

PART TWO: DIESEL - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 7 - CHARLES COUNTY, MARYLAND

PART THREE: DIESEL F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICKUP

PART TWO: DIESEL - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 6 - CARROL COUNTY, MARYLAND


